B024-56 CHEMICALS

BID TABULATION

FOR: VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
DATE: May 16, 2024

APPARENT LOW BIDS HIGHLIGHTED IN YELLOW

1 - Sodium Hypochlorite Per Gallon $2.2850 $2.4830 $2.1900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.4500 $2.0600
2 - Calcium Hypochlorite Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.8857 No Bid No Bid
3A - Liquid Caustic Soda 25% Per Gallon $1.3266 $1.3129 $2.0000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.4200
3B - Liquid Caustic Soda 50% (55 Gallon Drum) Per Gallon $4.5376 $3.1300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.5000
4 - Liquid Aluminum Sulfate (50 Ib Bag) Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.3900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5- Liquid Sodium Permanganate (275 Gallon Tote) Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.3900 $12.1024 $12.7700 No Bid $14.0200 No Bid No Bid
6 - Sodium Fluoride (50 Ib Bag) Per Pound No Bid $1.2350 No Bid No Bid $1.9300 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 - Granular Phosphate Blend (5 Gallon Pail) Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.7600 $2.3100 $2.4400 No Bid $2.7506/52.1373 50# Bags* No Bid No Bid
8 - Activated Carbon Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.2124 No Bid No Bid
9 - Powdered Activated Carbon Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.6500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 - Liquid Ferric Chloride Per Pound $2.8447 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.6880 No Bid No Bid No Bid

B023-45 CHEMICALS

For: Various Departments
DATE: May 16, 2024
Time: 11:00 AM

APPARENT LOW BIDDERS

1. PVS MiniBulk - $2.06

G.Coyne Chemical Co - $3.8857

3A UNIVAR USA Inc - $1.3129

3B UNIVAR USA Inc - $3.1300

Holland Company Inc - $2.3900

Carus Coproration - $12.1024

UNIVAR USA Inc - $1.2350

G.Coyne Chemical Co -$3.2124

4
5
6
7 Carus Corporation -$2.3100
8
9

Chemrite Inc -$ 1.6500

10 Borden & Remington - $2.8447

7-10 Business Days Packaged Delivery
10-14 Business Days Bulk Delivery




