B021-30 CHEMICALS

BID TABULATION

FOR: VARIOUS DEPARTMMENTS
DATE: April 29, 2021
SUBMITTED BY: Susan Martel

ITEM # Price Desc. | Borden & Remington Corp | Slack Chemical Co | Holland Co Inc | Chemrite Inc | Carus Corp | Shannon Chemical

1 - Calcium Hypochlorite Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 - Sodium Fluoride (50 Ib Bag) Per Pound $0.9967 $1.1980 No Bid $1.2900 No Bid No Bid

3 - Granular Phosphate Blend (5 Gallon Pail) Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.2100 $1.2740

4 - Activated Carbon Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 - Liquid Ferric Chloride Per Pound $1.9573 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6 - Sodium Bisulfite Solution Per Pound No Bid $2.1240 $1.5900 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ITEM # Price Desc. | Astro Chemicals Inc | General Carbon Corp | Kemira Water Inc G Coyne Chemical Co JCl Jones Chemicals | PVS Minibulk Inc

1 - Calcium Hypochlorite Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.8714/lb No Bid No Bid
2 - Sodium Fluoride {50 Ib Bag) Per Pound $1.3500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 - Granular Phosphate Blend {5 Gallon Pail) Per Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.5725/1b No Bid No Bid
4 - Activated Carbon Per Pound No Bid $2.4000 No Bid $1.8207'55/$1.6180 40 Ib No Bid No Bid
5 - Liquid Ferric Chloride Per Pound No Bid No Bid $1.9650 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 - Sodium Bisulfite Solution Per Pound $2.0500 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.7000 $2.1000




