
B020-29 Bituminous  
Concrete, Concrete,  
Stone and Sand  

 L. Suzio Concrete Co., Inc. 
 L. Suzio Asphalt Co., Inc. 
York Hill Trap Rock 

 Tilcon Connecticut, Inc 
 

 975 Westfield Road PO Box 1357 
 Meriden, CT 06450 New Britain, CT 06050-1357 
For:  DPW, Highway  Henry E. Suzio Bill Linehan 
DATE:  May 5, 2020  203-237-8421   860-357-1635   
TIME:   11:00 AM 203-238-9177 Fax 860-225-1865 Fax 
 sales@suzioyorkhill.com  

 
blinehan@tilcon-inc.com  
 

1A)  Class I-Bituminous        
Concrete:  Price per Ton           
at Plant: ………………..                       $78.50                                           $79.95 
PLANT LOCATION:                        Meriden                                    Wallingford 
 
1B)  Class I- Bituminous 
Concrete:  Price per Ton 
Delivered: ……………..                       $83.13                                             NO BID 
  
2A)   Class II-Bituminous 
Concrete:  Price per Ton                                                             
at Plant: ……………….                       $84.25                                             $84.80 
PLANT LOCATION:                       Meriden                                      Wallingford 
 
2B)  Class II-Bituminous 
Concrete:  Price per Ton 
Delivered: …………….                       $88.88                                            NO BID 
 
3A)  Class III-Bituminous 
Concrete:  Price per Ton                                                              
at Plant: ……………….                       $91.25                                            NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                       Meriden        
 
3B)  Class III-Bituminous 
Concrete:  Price per Ton 
Delivered: …………….                       $95.88                                            $94.41 
 
4A)  Class IV-Bituminous 
Concrete:  Price per Ton                                                                                    
at Plant: ………………..                      $79.50                                            $79.95  
PLANT LOCATION:                      Meriden                                      Wallingford 
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4B)  Class IV-Bituminous 
Concrete:  Price per Ton 
Delivered: …………….                         $83.13                                         NO BID 
 
5A) Class 12 Bituminous 
Concrete: Price per Ton 
At Plant: ……………….                        $93.00                                         NO BID  
PLANT LOCATION:                         Meriden                   
 
5B) Class 12 Bituminous 
Concrete: Price per Ton 
Delivered: ……………..                          $97.63                                       NO BID 
 
6A) Hot Mix Asphalt  
Superpave 0.50 Design Level 2 
Per St. of CT DOT Requirements 
Price per Ton at Plant: ……                       $98.00                                     $79.95 
PLANT LOCATION:                             Meriden                              Wallingford        
  
6B) Hot Mix Asphalt  
Superpave 0.50 Design Level 2 
Per St. of CT DOT Requirements 
Price per Ton - Delivered: …                     $102.63                                 NO BID 
 
7A)  Hot Mix Asphalt Superpave 
1.0 Design Level 2 
Per St of CT DOT Requirements 
Price per Ton at Plant: …………              $98.00                                   $76.94 
PLANT LOCATION                              Meriden                             Wallingford   
7B)  Hot Mix Asphalt Superpave 
1.0 Design Level 2 
Per St. of CT DOT Requirements 
Price per Ton - Delivered: ………            $102.63                                 NO BID 

mailto:sales@suzioyorkhill.com
mailto:blinehan@tilcon-inc.com


   B020-29 Bituminous  
Concrete, Concrete,  
Stone and Sand  

L. Suzio Concrete Co., Inc. 
 L. Suzio Asphalt Co., Inc. 
York Hill Trap Rock 

 Tilcon Connecticut, Inc 
 

 975 Westfield Road PO Box 1357 
 Meriden, CT 06450 New Britain, CT 06050-1357 
For:  DPW, Highway  Henry E. Suzio Bill Linehan 
DATE:  May 5, 2020  203-237-8421   860-357-1635   
TIME:   11:00 AM 203-238-9177 Fax 860-225-1865 Fax 
 sales@suzioyorkhill.com  

 
blinehan@tilcon-inc.com  
 

                 
8A)  Tack Coat Emulsion: 
Price per 5 Gallon Pail                                                                          
at Plant: ……………….                            $58.00                                   $61.25 
PLANT LOCATION:                            Meriden                              Wallingford 
8B)  Price per 5 Gallon Pail 
Delivered: …………….                           NO BID                                NO BID                                    
 
9A) Class 5 Cold Patch,  
Price per Ton at Plant: …                        $121.00                                  NO BID                                    
PLANT LOCATION:                           Meriden                    
 
9B) Winter Hot Mix (Non- 
Recycled, Price per Ton at Plant:            NO BID                                NO BID                                     
PLANT LOCATION: 
 
10) 3,000 PSI Test Concrete         
Price per Cubic Yard                
Delivered: ……………….                       $120.00                                 NO BID                                            
 
11) 3,500 PSI Test Concrete 
Price per Cubic Yard 
Delivered: ……………….                       $124.00                                NO BID                                            
 
12) 4,000 PSI Test Concrete, 
Price per Cubic Yard 
Delivered: …………………                   $128.00                                 NO BID                                           
 
13) 4,500 PSI Test Concrete 
Price per Cubic Yard 
Delivered: …………………                   $132.00                                 NO BID                                              
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Dunning Industries 
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stoneconstructioninc@gmail.com NMcGuffic@DunningIndustries.com zwallyhauling@hotmail.com  
 

 
14)  5,000 PSI Test Concrete 
Price per Cubic Yard                                                                                                              
Delivered: …………………               $136.00                    NO BID                      NO BID                               NO BID                                        NO BID 
 
15A)    1/2” Stone,                                                                         
Price per Ton at Plant: …….               $22.95                      $18.95                         NO BID        $25.00                                 NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                      Meriden                 Wallingford                                                             Farmington 
 
15B)    1/2” Stone, Price  
per Ton, Delivered: …….…               $26.24                      $25.10                          NO BID                                $31.50                                           $24.50 
 
16A)   3/4”Stone,                                                                          
Price per Ton at Plant: …….         $20.35                     $18.90                           NO BID                                  $25.00                                        NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                      Meriden               Wallingford                                                               Farmington        
  
16B)  3/4” Stone, Price per                 
Ton, Delivered: ……………              $23.64                     $23.15                           $22.25                                     $31.50                                        $23.00 
 
17A)  1 1/4” Stone,                                                                        
Price per Ton at Plant: …….              $19.30                     $18.15                            NO BID                                   $25.00                                       NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                     Meriden              Wallingford                                                                 Farmington       
 
17B)  1 1/4” Stone, Price per    
Ton, Delivered: ……………              $22.59                    $22.40                              $21.50                                     $31.50                                        $22.50 
 
18A)  3/4” Processed Stone,  
Price per Ton at Plant:                        $13.50                   $11.25                             NO BID                                  NO BID                                     NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                      Meriden            Wallingford 
 
18B) 3/4 ” Processed Stone,  
Price per Ton, Delivered: …              $16.79                    $15.50                              $16.50                                   NO BID                                      $19.50 
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19A) 1 1/4” Processed Stone,  
Price per Ton at Plant:                         $13.50                              $10.95                              NO BID                                       NO BID                              NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                     Meriden                        Wallingford 
 
19B) 1 1/4” Processed Stone,  
Price per Ton, Delivered: ……            $16.79                             $15.20                              $16.00                                          NO BID                               $19.50 
 
20A) Crushed Recycled Aggregate 
4”Minus: Price per Ton 
At Plant: ……………………               $9.00                             NO BID                            NO BID                                       NO BID                              NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                      Meriden                                                                
                                                                                                                       
20B) Crushed Recycled Aggregate 
4”Minus: Price per Ton 
Delivered: ……………………            $12.29                           NO BID                           NO BID                                         NO BID                              $19.50 
 
21A) Reclaimed Aggregate 
1 1/4” Minus, Price per Ton 
At Plant: ………………….                  $13.00                           NO BID                          NO BID                                         NO BID                              NO BID 
 
21B) Reclaimed Aggregate 
1 1/4” Minus, Price per Ton 
Delivered: ………………                    $16.29                           NO BID                          NO BID                                         NO BID                              $19.50 
 
22A)  Modified Rip-Rap,       
Price per Ton at Plant: ……                  $20.75                          $18.35                             NO BID                                         NO BID                              NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                        Meriden                      New Britain          
 
22B)  Modified Rip-Rap, 
Price per Ton Delivered:                      NO BID                         $23.60                            $23.50                                            NO BID                              $25.50 
23A) Intermediate Rip-Rap                                                           
Price per Ton at Plant: ……                  $21.30                           $20.65                            NO BID                                        NO BID                               NO BID    
PLANT LOCATION:                        Meriden               

mailto:hesuzio@suzioyorkhill.com
mailto:blinehan@tilcon-inc.com
mailto:stoneconstructioninc@gmail.com
mailto:NMcGuffic@DunningIndustries.com
mailto:zwallyhauling@hotmail.com


B020-29 Bituminous  
Concrete, Concrete,  
Stone and Sand  

L. Suzio Concrete Co., Inc. 
 L. Suzio Asphalt Co., Inc. 
York Hill Trap Rock 

 Tilcon Connecticut, Inc 
 

The Stone Construction Co Inc 
 

Dunning Industries 
 

 Zwally Hauling LLC 
 

 975 Westfield Road PO Box 1357 168 Main Street South 105 Brickyard Road 740 No Washington Ave 
 Meriden, CT 06450 New Britain, CT 06050-1357 Southbury, CT  06488 Farmington, CT  06032 Bridgeport, CT 06606 
For:  DPW, Highway  Henry E. Suzio Bill Linehan George H Stone Nicholas McGuffic George Zwally 
DATE:  May 5, 2020 203-237-8421   860-357-1635   203-264-6501 860-677-1616 203-521-8768   
TIME:   11:00 AM 203-238-9177 Fax 860-225-1865 Fax 203-264-3062 Fax 860-674-0668 Fax  
 hesuzio@suzioyorkhill.com  

 
blinehan@tilcon-inc.com  
 

stoneconstructioninc@gmail.com NMcGuffic@DunningIndustries.com zwallyhauling@hotmail.com  
 

 
23B)  Intermediate Rip-Rap,    
Price per Ton Delivered: …                  NO BID             NO BID           $28.00                         NO BID                                    $29.75 
 
24A)  Standard Rip-Rap,                                                                                                                
Price per Ton at Plant: ……                 $22.00                              $18.50                         NO BID                       NO BID                                    NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                       Meriden                         Wallingford  
 
24B)  Standard Rip-Rap, 
Price per Ton Delivered: ….                NO BID                            NO BID                     $28.00                          NO BID                                     $33.50 
 
25A)  Screenings, Price                                                                    
per Ton at Plant:………….                 $16.00                               $15.10                         NO BID                       NO BID                                    NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                      Meriden                         Wallingford 
 
25B)  Screenings, Price per                                                                
Ton, Delivered: …………                   $19.29                               $19.35                         $16.50                        NO BID                                     $15.50 
 
26)  Full Concrete Block  
(2 ft H X 3 ft W X 4 ft L)-                                                                      
PICKED UP:                                                                                  
PRICE EACH AT PLANT:                  $48.00                            NO BID                       NO BID                       NO BID                                    NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                       Meriden          
 
27)  Half Concrete Block                                                                       
(2 ft H X 3 ft W X 2 ft L) -                                                                         
PICKED UP:                                       $40.00                            NO BID                       NO BID                       NO BID                                    NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                       Meriden      
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28) Disposal/Recycling:   
City will deliver materials 
such a clean concrete, asphalt,  
brick and rock only to the                    **EXCLUDES  
Contractor’s site or other                     BRICK & ROCK                                                                                     
approved location):                                                                                                                        
PRICE PER TON: ………..                         $9.75*                       $10.00                     NO BID                     NO BID                              NO BID 
Disposal Site Address:              
 
29A)  Temporary PreCast 
Concrete Barrier Curb: 
Price per Linear Foot at               
Plant: …………………..                         NO BID                      NO BID                    NO BID                     NO BID                              NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                                                                               
 
29B)  Temporary PreCast                     
Concrete Barrier Curb: 
Price per Linear Foot 
Delivered to Various                   
Locations: ……………….                       NO BID                      NO BID                  NO BID                     NO BID                               NO BID 
 
30A)  Washed Sand:                              
Price per TON at                        
Plant: …………………….                      $31.00                         NO BID         NO BID                   NO BID                              NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                          Meriden                        
 
30B)  Washed Sand: 
Price per TON,                        
Delivered: ……………..                         $34.29                        NO BID                   $25.75                         NO BID                             NO BID 
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31A)  Mason Sand: 
Price per TON at                           
Plant: …………………..                        $33.00                          NO BID                             NO BID                                       $23.00                        NO BID 
PLANT LOCATION:                         Meriden                                                                                                                    Farmington          
 
31B)  Mason Sand: 
Price per TON,                           
Delivered: ………………                       $36.29                        NO BID                                 $27.75                                       $29.50                        NO BID 
                                                          
32A) Screened Sand 
Delivered Mon-Fri   
Delivered Price per Ton: ….                   $31.29                        NO BID                                 $22.75                                     NO BID                      $15.50 
 
32B) Screened Sand 
Delivered Saturdays,  
Sundays Or Holidays 
Delivered Price per Ton: ……               NO BID                     NO BID                                 NO BID                                  NO BID                       $18.50  
 
32C) Screened Sand 
Picked-Up Price per Ton: ….                 $28.00        NO BID                             NO BID                                   NO BID              NO BID  
PLANT LOCATION:                                                               
 
Will your company accept 
a P-Card as payment? …..                       YES                           NO              NO                                        N/A                             N/A 
Payment Term Discount: ..                  0% net 30                 1% net 20         0% net 30                             0% net 30                   0% net 30                  
Discount if paying with P-Card:              N/A                            NO                                           NO                                        N/A                             N/A                    
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