
B019-02 CHEMICALS Borden & Remington Corp. New Haven Chlor-Alkali 

Dba H. Krevit & Co., Inc. 

Kuehne Chemical Co., 

 Inc 

For: City of Meriden 63 Water Street PO Box 9433 86 North Hackensack Ave 

Dept of Public Utilities Fall River, MA 02722 New Haven, CT 06534 South Kearny, NJ 07032 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Robert F. Bogan, Pres. Thomas Ross, Senior VP Kelly A. Ward 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-508-675-0096 203-772-3350 1-973-589-0700 

 1-508-672-5670 Fax 203-776-0730 Fax 1-973-589-4866 Fax 

 tresendes@boremco.com  a_murthy@hkrevit.com 

 

bids@kuehnecompany.com  

ITEM 1) SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE             

IN BULK for VARIOUS DEPTS: 

Manufacturer: ………………….            Borden & Remington       New Haven Chlor-Alkali           Kuehne Chemical 

      

Manufactured in the USA?: …..                   YES                                         YES                                        YES 

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached?   …………………….                    YES                                        YES                                         YES 

                                                                                                                

1A) Delivered price per gallon 

BULK deliveries for 12-Month 

Period (8/1/18 - 6/30/19) for 

WPCF, Estimated Annual 

Demand:  30,000 gallons:                          $1.095                                  $0.9239                                $1.60 
 

Delivered price per gallon 

BULK deliveries for @ 6-Month 

Period (8/1/18 - 1/31/19), for 

WPCF, Estimated Annual 

Demand:  15,000 gallons:                          $1.095                                  $0.9239                                $1.50 
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

1B) Delivered price per gallon 

BULK deliveries for @ 12-Month 

Period (8/1/18 - 6/30/19) for  

Water, Estimated Annual 

Demand:  35,000 gallons:                        $ 1.095                                 $0.9239                                  $1.60 
 

Delivered price per gallon 

BULK deliveries for @ 6-Month 

Period (8/1/18 - 1/31/19)for  

Water, Estimated  

Demand:  17,500 gallons: ……              $ 1.095                                  $0.9239                                 $1.50 
 

Accept P-Card: …………………               NO                                          YES                                          NO 

Discount: ……………………….               N/A                                     1% net 30                                     N/A 

Discount applies with Credit Card?            N/A                                          NO                                           NO 

   

  

mailto:tresendes@boremco.com
mailto:a_murthy@hkrevit.com
mailto:bids@kuehnecompany.com


 

B019-02 CHEMICALS George S. Coyne Chemical Co, 

Inc. 

For: City of Meriden 3015 State Road 

Dept of Public Utilities Croydon, PA 19021 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Donald Cy. Helwig, VP/CFO 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-215-785-3000 

 1-215-785-1585 Fax 

 bidadministration@coynechemical.com  

 

ITEM 2) CALCIUM HYPOCHLORITE 

(HTH)  FOR WPCF AND WATER IN 

25-LB Corrosive Resistant Containers: 

Manufacturer:  ………………………                  Westlake/Axiall 

       

Manufactured in the USA?: ……….                            YES 

 

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? …………………………..                             YES 

 

Delivered price per LB in 25 LB 

Containers, for 12-Month Period 

(8/1/18 - 6/30/19), Anticipated                          **For 50 Lb Pails 

Combined Annual Demand:  500 lbs:                    **$2.4615/lb             NOT AWARDED 

 

Delivered price per LB in 25 LB 

Containers, for 12-Month Period 

(8/1/18 - 1/31/19), Est. Combined                       **For 50 Lb. Pails 

Demand:  250 lbs: ………………..                       **$2.4615/lb   

   
Accept P-Card: ………………                                      NO 

Discount:  …………………...                                       N/A 

Discount applies with credit card:                                 N/A 

 

                                                                        
                                                                                                                                           

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

  

mailto:bidadministration@coynechemical.com


B019-02 CHEMICALS Borden & Remington Corp. New Haven Chlor-Alkali 

Dba H. Krevit & Co., Inc. 

Kuehne Chemical Co., 

 Inc 

For: City of Meriden 63 Water Street PO Box 9433 86 North Hackensack Ave 

Dept of Public Utilities Fall River, MA 02722 New Haven, CT 06534 South Kearny, NJ 07032 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Robert F. Bogan, Pres. Thomas Ross, Senior VP Kelly A. Ward 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-508-675-0096 203-772-3350 1-973-589-0700 

 1-508-672-5670 Fax 203-776-0730 Fax 1-973-589-4866 Fax 

 tresendes@boremco.com  a_murthy@hkrevit.com 

 

bids@kuehnecompany.com  

ITEM 3) LIQUID CAUSTIC  

SODA 25% FOR WATER-  

IN BULK (Split Delivery)  
% of Sodium Hydroxide in 

solution:  …………………….                        25%                                  Minimum 25%                             25% 

Manufacturer: ………………             Borden & Remington          New Haven Chlor-Alkali          Kuehne Chemical 

 

Manufactured in the USA?:….                       YES                                       YES                                          YES 

If not manufactured in USA,  

then where? ……………….….                  

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? ………………………                    YES                                        YES                                         YES 

 

3A)  Delivered price per gallon BULK 

for @ 12-Month Period (8/1/18-6/30/19),  

Est. Annual Demand: 25,000 gallons  

split between 4 plants: …………..                $1.5812                              $1.32                                   $2.40 

 

Delivered price per gallon BULK 

for @ 6-Month Period (8/1/18-1/31/19),  

Est. Demand: 12,500 gallons  

split between 4 plants: …………..                 $1.5812                            $1.32                                    $2.00 
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

3B) LIQUID CAUSTIC  

SODA FOR WATER IN 55-GAL 

DRUMS:    50% 
Percentage of Sodium Hydroxide in 

solution: ……………………..……                 50%                            Minimum 50% 

Manufacturer: ……………………                 OLIN                            OXY CHEM 

Manufactured in the USA?:……..                    YES                                     YES 

If not manufactured in USA,                         

then where? ……………………..                                                                                                                                                                                

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? ……………………….                     YES                                     YES 

 
3B)  Delivered price per gallon for  

@ 12-Month Period (8/1/18-6/30/19),  

in 55 Gallon Drums 

Est. Annual Demand: 4 Drums: …..                $3.75                              $5.38                                    NO BID 
 

Delivered price per gallon for  

@ 6-Month Period (8/1/18-1/31/19),  

in 55 Gallon Drums 

Est. Demand: 2 Drums: …………….             $3.75                              $5.38                                     NO BID 
Accept P-Card: ………………                        NO                                    YES 

Discount:  …………………...                        N/A                               1% net 30 

Discount applies with credit card:                   N/A                                    N/A   

mailto:tresendes@boremco.com
mailto:a_murthy@hkrevit.com
mailto:bids@kuehnecompany.com


B019-02 CHEMICALS Univar USA, Inc. 

For: City of Meriden 200 Dean Sievers Place 

Dept of Public Utilities Morrisville, PA 19067 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Michael Crea 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-215-337-5411 

 1-215-337-6290 Fax 

 micheal.crea@univar.com  

ITEM 3) LIQUID CAUSTIC  

SODA 25% FOR WATER-  

IN BULK (Split Delivery)  
% of Sodium Hydroxide in 

solution:  …………………….                        25%                               

Manufacturer: ………………             Univar USA, Inc. 

  

Manufactured in the USA?:….                       YES                             

If not manufactured in USA,  

then where? ……………….….                  

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? ………………………                    YES                              

 

3A)  Delivered price per gallon BULK 

for @ 12-Month Period (8/1/18-6/30/19),  

Est. Annual Demand: 25,000 gallons  

split between 4 plants: …………..                $1.433                           
 

Delivered price per gallon BULK 

for @ 6-Month Period (8/1/18-1/31/19),  

Est. Demand: 12,500 gallons  

split between 4 plants: …………..                 $1.393                          
-------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

3B) LIQUID CAUSTIC  

SODA FOR WATER IN 55-GAL 

DRUMS:    50% 
Percentage of Sodium Hydroxide in 

solution: ……………………..……                 50%                             

Manufacturer: ……………………              Univar US, Inc.  

 

Manufactured in the USA?:……..                    YES                                

If not manufactured in USA,                         

then where? ……………………..                                                                                                                                                                                

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? ……………………….                     YES                             

 
3B)  Delivered price per gallon for  

@ 12-Month Period (8/1/18-6/30/19),  

in 55 Gallon Drums 

Est. Annual Demand: 4 Drums: …..               $4.1485                              
 

Delivered price per gallon for  

@ 6-Month Period (8/1/18-1/31/19),  

in 55 Gallon Drums 

Est. Demand: 2 Drums: …………….             $4.1485              
   

Accept P-Card: ………………                                  NO 

Discount:  …………………...                                  N/A 

Discount applies with credit card:                             N/A  

mailto:micheal.crea@univar.com


 
B019-02 CHEMICALS Holland Co., Inc. Thatcher Co. 

For: City of Meriden 153 Howland Ave PO Box 27407 

Dept of Public Utilities Adams, MA 01220-1199 Salt Lake City, UT 84127 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Mathew B. Holland, Manager Craig N. Thatcher, Pres. 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-413-743-1292 1-315-589-9330 

 1-413-743-1298 Fax 1-315-589-9835 Fax 

 hcoffice@hollandcompany.com  Kellen.camp@tchem.com 

Wendy.richmond@tchem.com  

ITEM 4) LIQUID ALUMINUM 

SULFATE (For Water) IN BULK: 

Manufacturer: …………………...           Holland Co., Inc.                        Thatcher Corp. 

 

Manufactured in the USA?: …….                    YES                                            YES 

If not manufactured in USA,  

then where?: …………………….            

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? ………………………                       YES                                           YES 

 

4) Delivered PRICE PER GALLON 

(in BULK) for @ 12-Month Period           **1,000 gallon  

(8/1/18 - 6/30/19):                                     Minimum Delivery 

Est. Annual Demand:  4,500 gallons:            **$1.53                                  $2.7334 
 

Delivered PRICE PER GALLON  

(in BULK) for @ 6-Month Period             **1,000 gallon 

(8/1/18 - 1/31/19):                                     Minimum Delivery 

Est. Demand:  2,250 gallons: ……                **$1.46                                  $2.7334 
 

Accept P-Card: ………………                           NO                                            NO 

Discount:  …………………...                           None                                         N/A 

Discount applies with credit card:                   N/A                                       N/A 

  

mailto:hcoffice@hollandcompany.com
mailto:Kellen.camp@tchem.com
mailto:Wendy.richmond@tchem.com


 
B019-02 CHEMICALS Thatcher Co. Faesy & Besthoff, LLC 

For: City of Meriden PO Box 27407 1492 High Ridge Rd, Suite 2 

Dept of Public Utilities Salt Lake City, UT 84127 Stamford, CT 06903 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Craig N. Thatcher, Pres. Anthony Besthoff, Mgr. 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-315-589-9330 1-203-329-7000 

 1-315-589-9835 Fax 1-203-329-7003 Fax 

 Kellen.camp@tchem.com 

Wendy.richmond@tchem.com  

info@faesyandbesthoff.com  

 

ITEM 5) COPPER SULFATE 

(FOR WATER) IN 50-LB BAGS: 

Manufacturer: …………………..            Chem One Ltd                         Fabrica de Sulfato/Quimag 

Manufactured in the USA?: ……                 NO                                                 NO  

If not manufactured in USA,  

then where?: ………………..….                Mexico                                          Mexico 

 

Product Data Sheets and MSDS  

attached?  ………………………..                YES                                              YES 

Delivered PRICE PER POUND   

(in 50-LB BAGS) for @ 12-Month                                                           **40 lb Bags 

Period (8/1/18 - 6/30/19):                                                                    Pallet 42” x 48” x 3 1/2” 

Est Annual Demand:  20,000 lbs:                 $1.63                                        $1.58 

 

Delivered PRICE PER POUND  

(in 50-LB BAGS) for @ 6-Month 

Period (8/1/18 - 1/31/19):     

Est.  Demand:  10,000 lbs: ………              $1.63                                         $1.58 
 

Accept P-Card: ………………                     NO                                                 NO 

Discount:  …………………...                      N/A                                                N/A 

Discount applies with credit card:                 N/A                                               N/A 

  

mailto:Kellen.camp@tchem.com
mailto:Wendy.richmond@tchem.com
mailto:info@faesyandbesthoff.com


 
B019-02 CHEMICALS Borden & Remington 

Corp. 

George S. Coyne 

Chemical Co, Inc. 

Univar USA, Inc. 

For: City of Meriden 63 Water Street 3015 State Road 200 Dean Sievers Place 

Dept of Public Utilities Fall River, MA 02722 Croydon, PA 19021 Morrisville, PA 19067 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Robert F. Bogan, Pres. Donald Cy. Helwig, 

VP/CFO 

Michael Crea 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-508-675-0096 1-215-785-3000 1-215-337-5411 

 1-508-672-5670 Fax 1-215-785-1585 Fax 1-215-337-6290 Fax 

 tresendes@boremco.com  bidadministration@coynechemical.

com  
micheal.crea@univar.com  

 

ITEM 6) POTASSIUM  

PERMANGANATE (For Water) 

IN 55-LB PLASTIC DRUMS  

WITH HANDLES:                                                                             Organic Industries 

Manufacturer: ………………..                    Carus                                       PVT Ltd                         Carus Corp.  

Manufactured in the USA?: ….                    YES                                 NO (NOT IN USA)                 YES 

Product Data Sheets and  

MSDS attached? ……………..                    YES                                            YES                                YES 

 

Delivered PRICE PER LB 

(in 50-LB PLASTIC DRUMS  

W/Handles) for @ 12-Month 

Period (8/1/18 - 6/30/19):    

Est. Annual Demand: 5,000 LBS:             $3.708                                    $1.8975                         $3.7444 
                                                                                                               (NOT USA MADE) 

Delivered PRICE PER LB 

(in 50-LB PLASTIC DRUMS 

W/Handles) for @ 6-Month 

Period (8/1/18 - 1/31/19):    

Est.  Demand:  2,500 LBS:                       $3.708                                    $1.8975                           $3.7444 

 

Accept P-Card: ………………                  NO                                              NO                                       NO 

Discount:  …………………...                  N/A                                              N/A                                      N/A 

Discount applies with credit card:             N/A                                              N/A                                     N/A 

  

mailto:tresendes@boremco.com
mailto:bidadministration@coynechemical.com
mailto:bidadministration@coynechemical.com
mailto:micheal.crea@univar.com


 

 

B019-02 CHEMICALS Borden & Remington Corp. Monson Companies LLC 

For: City of Meriden 63 Water Street 39 Mechanic St, Ste 200 

Dept of Public Utilities Fall River, MA 02722 Westbrook, ME 04092 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Robert F. Bogan, Pres. Jeff Pellerin, Sr. VP 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-508-675-0096 1-207-885-5572 ext 423 

 1-508-672-5670 Fax 1-207-885-0569 Fax 
 tresendes@boremco.com  jpellerin@monsonco.com  

ITEM 7) SODIUM FLUORIDE 

FOR WATER IN 50-LB (OR  

25 Kg BAGS:                                                                                             Zhuzhau Ming 

Manufacturer: ……………….                   WEGO                                 Zine Chemical Co. 

                                                                   

Manufactured in the USA?:…                      NO                                              NO 

If not manufactured in USA,  

then where?  …………………..                China                                            China       

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? ……………………..                   YES                                             YES 

 

Delivered PRICE PER LB 

(in 50-LB BAGS) for @                                                                   **Minimum order 2 Pallets 

12-Month Period (8/1/18 - 6/30/19):                                                  (88 Bags) per delivery                        

Est. Annual Demand:  30,000 LBS:           $0.7845                                 **$0.855 

 

Delivered PRICE PER LB  

(in 50-LB BAGS) for @                                                                   **Minimum order 2 Pallets 

6-Month Period (8/1/18 - 1/31/19):                                                      (88 bags) per delivery 

Anticipated Demand:  15,000 LBS:            $0.7845                                   $0.855 

 

State Container Size:  ………..                50 LB BAG                                 50 LB BAG 

 

Accept P-Card:……………….                      NO                                               NO 

Discount:…………………….                       N/A                                              N/A 

Discount applies with credit card:                  N/A                                              N/A 

  

mailto:tresendes@boremco.com
mailto:jpellerin@monsonco.com


 

 
B019-02 CHEMICALS  

For: City of Meriden  

Dept of Public Utilities  

Date:  August 1, 2018  

Time:  11:00 A.M.  

  

  

ITEM 8) GRANULAR  

PHOSPHATE BLEND FOR  

WATER IN 5-GALLON  

Polyethylene Pails 

EST. ANNUAL DEMAND:  

45,000 LBS:                            

% of Ortho: ………………….              

% of Poly Phosphate: ……….              

Manufacturer: ……………….    

Manufactured in the USA?:…            

If not manufactured in USA,  

then where? …………………                                                                             

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? …………………..                  

 

Delivered PRICE PER LB 

(in 5-Gallon Pails) for @ 

12-Month Period (8/1/18-6/30/19):                      CHEMICAL REMOVED FROM  

Est. Annual Demand:  45,000 LBS:                            BID VIA ADDENDUM 

 

Delivered PRICE PER LB 

(in 5-Gallon Pails) for @ 

6-Month Period (8/1/18 - 1/31/19): 

Est. Demand:  22,500 LBS:                            

 
 

 

  



B019-02 CHEMICALS General Carbon Corp. 

For: City of Meriden 33 Paterson St 

Dept of Public Utilities Paterson, NJ 07501 

Date:  August 1, 2018 Mick O’Shea, Sales Engineer 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-973-523-2223 

 1-973-523-1494 Fax 

 moshea@generalcarbon.com  

ITEM 9A) ACTIVATED CARBON 

IN 1,000 LB Dispensable  

Super Sacks FOR WPCF – 

Manufacturer:  …………………..                          Cabot Norit            

Manufactured in the USA?.........                                  YES       

Product Data Sheets and MSDS  

attached? …………………..                                        YES   

CHEMICAL WEIGHT PER 

CUBIC FOOT: ………………….                               25 LBS 

What Size Container? …………..                    

Delivered PRICE PER LB ( in  

1,000 LB Dispensable Super Sacks) 

for @ 12-Month Period 

(8/1/18 - 6/30/19):  Est. Annual  

Demand: 16,000 LBS: ……………                          NO BID 

 

Delivered PRICE PER LB ( in  

1,000 LB Dispensable Super Sacks)  

for @ 6-Month Period 

(8/1/18 - 1/31/19):  Est. Anticipated  

Demand: 8,000 LBS: ……………                            NO BID 

---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

ITEM 9A) ACTIVATED CARBON 

IN 1,000 LB Dispensable  

Super Sacks FOR WPCF – 

 

Delivered PRICE PER LB ( in  

40-LB Bags for @ 12-Month Period 

(8/1/18 - 6/30/19):  Est. Annual  

Demand: 16,000 LBS: ……………                          $2.08 
 

Delivered PRICE PER LB ( in  

40-LB Bags for @ 6-Month Period 

(8/1/18 - 1/31/19):  Est. Anticipated  

Demand: 8,000 LBS: ……………..                          $2.08 
 

Accept P-Card:……………….                                  Yes    

Discount:…………………….                                   N/A 

Discount applies with credit card:                              N/A 

 
  

mailto:moshea@generalcarbon.com


 

 

B019-02 CHEMICALS Kemira Water Solutions, inc. Borden & Remington Corp. 

For: City of Meriden 4321 W. 6th Street 63 Water Street 

Dept of Public Utilities Lawrence, KS 66049 Fall River, MA 02722 

Date:  August 1, 2018 1-785-842-7424 Robert F. Bogan, Pres. 

Time:  11:00 A.M. 1-785-842-2629 Fax 1-508-675-0096 

 kwsna.bids@kemira.com 1-508-672-5670 Fax 

  tresendes@boremco.com  

 

ITEM 10)  Liquid Ferric Chloride 

In Bulk, For WPCF: 

Manufacturer: …………………                Kemira Water Solutions Inc.                        PVS 

                         

Manufactured in USA?: ……..                                Yes                                                   YES 

 

Product Data Sheets and MSDS 

attached? …………………..                                   Yes                                                    YES 

 

Delivered PRICE PER GALLON 

(in BULK) for @ 12-Month Period 

(8/1/18 - 6/30/19):  Est. Annual 

Demand:  20,000 gallons: ……….                       $1.613                                         $1.9633 

 

Delivered PRICE PER GALLON  

(in BULK) for @ 6-Month Period 

(8/1/18 - 1/31/19):  Est. Demand:  

10,000 gallons: …………………..                      $1.613                                          $1.9633 

  

Accept P-Card:……………….                               Yes                                                    NO 

Discount:…………………….                                N/A                                                   N/A 

Discount applies with credit card:                           N/A                                                   N/A                                                                                                            

 

 

mailto:tresendes@boremco.com

